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4.10.l Mattress Minimum

25" W X 75"l X 4"H

Cover and batting meet/exceed federal 

correctional flammability standards (16 CFR 

Part 1633, DOC Federal Flammability FF-4-

72, and California Technical Bulletins 129 

and 603)

$86.49 $61.90 $132.29 $66.25 No Bid No Bid $71.38

4.10.2 Mattress Cover

Heavy-duty vinyl laminate -  Open-end, 

must slip-over/fit mattress specified above 

(item for easy-on/off use; flame resistant, 

mildew and water resistant - wipes clean 

with soap and water

$21.51 $15.18 $49.19 $24.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.3 Bed Sheets

58” X 90”

Brand reference: Bob Barker T-130

Navy

SH5890NVN

Price per each

$3.41 $48.18 $169.19 $5.35 No Bid No Bid $3.32

4.10.4 Fitted Bedsheet

25” or 30” X 75” X 4” or 6”

Brand reference: Bob Barker Fitted Sheet,

130 thread count

Navy

FS3075NVN

Price per each

$2.56 $48.90 $179.29 $4.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.5 Pillow

Minimum 20” X 26” full size pillow, includes 

breathable PVC-coated polyester knit 

cover, dark green, wipes clean, includes 

tear-resistant cover, flame resistant – 

meets NFPA 701 flammability 

requirements, 100% polyester fiber pillow -

Brand Reference: Bob Barker MV2606

PS2026

Green

•

Price per each pillow

$9.35 $5.49 $81.59 $19.33 $13.00 No Bid No Bid
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4.10.6 Wool Blanket

Grey woven wool blanket

Minimum 4#’s each

Overstitched all sides

Fire-resistant in accordance with federal 

standard 16 CFR Part 1610, and/or ASTM 

D4151-92,

Washable and dryable

Minimum 66”X90”

Acceptable minimum wool content: 52%

Brand Reference: ICS Jail Supplies L010

•

Price per each blanket

$6.20 $7.88 $25.19 $13.18 $20.00 No Bid $6.77

4.10.7 Poly-cotton, Durable Prison Blanket

Minimum 55% polyester/30% acrylic/ 10% 

cotton/ 5% other fibers,

minimum 60” X 90” size, safe and fire 

resistant, meets/exceeds the ASTM D4151 

flammability test, strong, durable, seamless 

construction with stitching on all four-sides 

to prevent unraveling, soft/plush feel,

Grey with blue striping,

individually packed in a poly bag, sold 

individually or per case of 12

Price per each blanket

Brand Reference: Bob Barker Charm-Tex 

Durable Prison Blanket, 66X90, C26690GY

•

Price per each blanket or case of 12

$6.98 $6.00 $15.16 $12.65 $20.00 No Bid $6.74

4.10.8 EVA Sandal

100% Ethyl vinyl construction, Slip-

resistant, water-resistant, ventilated upper, 

lightweight material

Sizes: S-3XL Brand Reference: Bob Barker 

SNEVA-BK

Price per each pair of sandals or per case 

of 24

$2.95 $3.54 $13.09 $2.11 No Bid No Bid $2.16

4.10.9 Heavy Duty Sandal

One-piece molded PVC Vinyl construction, 

soft and flexible for indoor and outdoor use. 

No air pocket in sole. Durable and long-

lasting.

Sizes 6-16

Packaging: 24 pairs per case

Brand Reference: Bob Barker FPVSN2-

Orange

$2.38 $2.64 $9.39 $1.96 No Bid No Bid $1.79
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4.10.10 Mildew-Resistant Shower Sandal

Everyday PVC Sandal

No-Skid

Flexible

B-chek (or equal) to reduce odors

Mildew resistant

Sizes: S-3XL

Brand Reference: Bob Barker versatile PVC 

Sandal

FPVSN2-OR

•

Price per each pair of sandals

$2.38 $2.64 $10.69 $5.89 No Bid No Bid $2.79

4.10.11 Durable Canvas Step-In Shoe

Medium-weight, double layer canvas, mark-

resistant, durable outsoles, cushioned 

midsole, reinforced stress points at heel 

and toe

Sizes: 8-16

Brand reference: Bob Barker 25 5NV

•

Price per each pair of clogs

$5.15 $5.72 $23.69 $7.32 No Bid No Bid $2.61

4.10.12 Sweatpants

Adult Grey cotton/poly blend

Elastic cuffs

No drawstring and no pockets

Minimal shrinkage

Sizes: S-3XL

Price per each 

Brand Reference: Bob Barker SPGY

•

Price per each pair of pants

$5.85 $6.18 $21.89 $19.35 $21.00 No Bid $6.86

4.10.13 Sweatshirt

Adult crew neck pullover

Grey cotton/poly blend

Collar, Cuffs and waistband shall be cover 

seamed and ribbed with elastic cuff and 

waistband

Minimal shrinkage

No hood, no drawstring and no pockets

Sizes: S-3XL

Price per each

Brand Reference: Bob Barker SSGY

•

Price per each shirt

$6.25 $6.18 $21.89 $11.65 $25.00 No Bid $6.79

4.10.14 T-Shirt

Minimum 5.5-oz medium weight 

polyester/Cotton, Maroon, No-Pocket T-

shirt

Double-needle cover-stitched front neck

Seamless ribbed collar with shoulder-to-

shoulder tape

Double-needle stitched bottom hem and 

sleeves

Sizes: S-3XL

Price per each

Brand Reference: Bob Barker T-Shirts, 

Medium Weight – Maroon ZBTS

$4.50 $3.18 $13.09 No Bid $20.00 No Bid $4.84
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4.10.15 Women’s Underwear

100% cotton

Brief-style with double panel crotch with 

soft knitted leg and waistband for snug, 

comfortable fit. Shall withstand several 

washings/dryings

Must include all sizes: size 5-size 18 (S-

3XL)

Packaging: 12/pack

Brand reference for the JJC: Bob Barker 

351OR

Bob Barker 351BN

Brand Reference for the Jail: Bob Barker 

ELBLS

•

Price per each 12-pack

$10.99 $9.90 $47.09 $19.05 No Bid No Bid $8.89

4.10.16 Men’s Underwear

Boxers – Assorted colors and prints

Sizes: S-3XL

$20.50 $15.72 $49.69 $18.29 No Bid No Bid $18.49

4.10.17 Socks - Price per pack of 12 pairs $5.41 $6.18 $26.49 $9.66 $10.00 No Bid $5.93

4.10.18 Toothpaste

Minimum 1.5 oz. fluoride toothpaste

Mint, white

All plastic tube with twist cap

No animal fat or by-products, and no 

alcohol

Brand Reference:

Bob Barker FM15

•

Price per each case/144 tubes

$37.09 $32.90 $129.89 $47.68 No Bid No Bid $35.12

4.10.19 Toothbrush

3.25” Super Shorty, minimum 25-tuft, nylon 

bristles, individually sealed in clear bags

Brand reference: Bob Barker BBST25

•

Price per each case/144 brushes

$7.20 $6.72 $34.59 $8.91 No Bid No Bid $6.85

4.10.20 Toothbrush Cap

Cream color

Brand reference: Bob Barker NTBC

Price per case of 144

$10.08 $20.16 $62.19 $12.18 No Bid No Bid $9.54

4.10.21 Deodorant Soap, Individually Wrapped

Minimum 1.5 oz., wrapped, deodorant bar 

soap

No animal fat or by-products

Packaging: 500/case

Brand Reference: Bob Barker CS15

•

Price per each case/500 bars

$125.00 $56.36 $211.29 $97.50 No Bid No Bid $57.35
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4.10.22 Anti-bacterial Soap, Unwrapped

1.5# unwrapped antibacterial bar deodorant 

soap; average minimum 1.2 oz. bar

No animal fat or by-products

Packaging: 500/case

Brand Reference: Bob Barker AU15-C

•

Price per each case/500 bars

$50.00 $62.90 $805.48 $108.58 No Bid No Bid $55.03

4.10.23 Shampoo

Clear shampoo in clear bottle

pH balanced (5.5-7.0)

alcohol content does not exceed 0.5%

contains no animal-derived ingredients 

Individual Bottle: Minimum 2 fluid oz.

96 bottles per case

Brand Reference: Bob Barker Maximum 

Security Shampoo, 2 oz. #MS2402

•

Price per each case/96, 2-oz. bottles

$23.04 $28.90 $67.90 $45.60 No Bid No Bid $28.14

4.10.24 Razor

Single-stainless steel blade, clear plastic 

handle and razor head with clear 

removable safety cap, one-piece 

construction

Packaged: 10 razors per package, 100 

packages per box for 1,000 razors per case

Brand Reference: Bob Barker Maximum 

Security Clear Razor CLR1000

OR Bob Barker SR2000

•

Price per each case/1,000 razors

•

Price per each case/2,000 razors

$102.00 $86.90 $315.79 $86.81 No Bid No Bid $73.19

4.10.25 Comb, Pocket – No Handle

Black Plastic, bendable, combs & plastic 

afro picks

Minimum 5”

Price by the case

Brand Reference for the JJC: FC-5, Pick-5

Brand Reference for the Jail: Bob Barker 

C5B

•

Price per each case/2,160 combs

$2.76 $64.90 $172.89 $64.15 No Bid No Bid $52.23
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4.10.26 Cleaning Detergent

Disinfectant is phosphate-free formulation 

designed to provide effective cleaning,

deodorizing, and disinfection

• Formulated to disinfect non-porous 

surfaces such as floors, walls, metal 

surfaces,

stainless steel surfaces, porcelain, ceramic 

tile, and plastic

• Product deodorizes areas which generally 

are hard to keep smelling fresh

• One packet makes 1 Quart

80 packets per case. 12 cases per master 

case

Brand Reference: Bob Barker Disinfectant 

Cleaner #AC192

•

Price per master case (960 packets)

$76.80 $98.90 $170.09 $105.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.27 ID Band with Fasteners

Plastic polyethylene bracelet with metal 

fastener, stretch-resistant, can be written-

on

Colors: Orange/White and Green/White

Brand-reference: Bob Barker Clincher II 

Write-On Laminate, Fasteners #646

•

Price per each case of 500 bands/525 

fasteners

$216.35 $236.90 $483.49 $234.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.28 ID Band Fastener Tool

Compatible for use with above plastic ID 

band

Brand Reference: Bob Barker Fastening 

Tool for Clincher, #647

•

Price per each

$145.21 $141.18 $310.89 $153.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.29 Pen, Black-Ink

Jail safe flex pens, flexible and bendable, 

minimum 4.5” total length, black ink, clear 

plastic body and cap -

Price by the box/144 pens per box

Brand Reference: Bob Barker MSBP

ICS Jail Supplies M04FXP-W-BL

•

Price per each box/144 pens per box

$8.64 $14.68 $68.53 $22.68 No Bid No Bid $20.99
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4.10.30 Tampons

Bulk Sanitax Tampons

Individually wrapped with cardboard 

applicator

Regular

500/case

Price by the case

Brand Reference: Bob Barker #TPX500

ICS Jail Supplies T067-CS

•

Price per each case/500 tampons

$65.50 $87.90 $235.99 $90.05 No Bid No Bid $91.75

4.10.31 Sanitary Napkins, Bulk

Minimum 8.5 inches long

Center adhesive strip provides stay-in-

place adhesion Individually folded and 

wrapped

Packaging: 250/case

Price per case

Brand Reference: Bob Barker #2501MC

Amercare AF-250 or ICS Jail Supplies 

250IM

•

Price per each case/250 pads

$15.00 $39.90 $118.69 $29.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.32 Washcloths, Bath

Economy Washcloths,

Brown

Minimum .75# per dozen

Minimum 12” X 12”

100% cotton, dense looped terry cloth

Packaging: 12 per package

•

Price per each package/12

Brand Reference: ICS L017

$2.52 $3.89 $22.36 $3.25 No Bid No Bid $3.49

4.10.33 Towels, Bath – Dozen Pack

Economy Bath Towels

White

Minimum 6 pounds per dozen

Minimum 22” X 44”

100% cotton, dense looped terry cloth

minimum 400 GSM (grams per square 

meter)

Packaging: 12/pack

Price per pack of 12

Brand Reference: Bob Barker #BT224

ICS Jail Supplies L0162

•

Price per each package/12

$14.88 $16.72 $27.99 $21.75 No Bid No Bid $14.98
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4.10.34 Towels, Bath – Bale

Economy Bath Towels

White

Minimum 6 pounds per dozen

Minimum 22” X 44”

100% cotton, dense looped terry cloth

minimum 400 GSM (grams per square 

meter)

Packaging: 12-pack

Price per bale or 25 12-packs (300 cloths)

Brand Reference: Bob Barker BT224

ICS Jail Supplies L0162

•

Price per each bale of 25 twelve packs 

(300 per bale)

$372.00 $418.00 $35.69 $543.75 No Bid No Bid $374.50

4.10.35 15oz Rimmed Bowl

Polypropylene tableware

Brand Reference: Bob Barker 727B, 2 ½” H
$46.80 $145.90 $178.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.36 9oz Tumbler

Polypropylene Tableware, tumbler, 4” H

Brand Reference: Bob Barker 725B
$38.99 $47.90 $107.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.37 Tray No Bid No Bid $294.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.38 LifeLine Smock

Brand Reference: Bob Barker 505JR
$59.98 $68.90 $273.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.67

4.10.39 LifeLine Bed

All-in-one bed

Brand Reference: Bob Barker BBSSB
$96.93 $168.90 $577.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.98

4.10.40 Catalog Discount for Miscellaneous Items 

Not Specified - Available in the Vendor’s 

Current On-Line and Hard-Copy Catalog:

The bidder should provide the following 

information about their catalog:

Website address:

How often is the on-line catalog updated?

How often is the hard-copy catalog 

updated?

10% 15% 10% 10% No Bid 50% 15%
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4.10.41 Institutional Trousers - Black &  White 

Horizontal Stripes - Small
$7.13 $7.54 $18.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.29

4.10.42 Institutional Trousers - Black &  White 

Horizontal Stripes - Medium
$7.13 $7.54 $18.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.29

4.10.43 Institutional Trousers - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes - Large
$7.56 $7.54 $18.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.29

4.10.44 Institutional Trousers - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes - Xlarge
$7.82 $7.54 $18.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.29

4.10.45 Institutional Trousers - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes - 2X
$7.82 $7.54 $20.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.29

4.10.46 Institutional Trousers - Black &  White 

Horizontal Stripes - 3X
$7.82 $7.90 $22.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.84

4.10.47 Institutional Trousers - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes - 4X
$7.82 $7.90 $24.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.14

4.10.48 Institutional Trousers - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes - 6X
$9.69 $8.54 $30.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.09

4.10.49 Institutional Trousers - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -8X
$12.69 $8.90 $36.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.09

4.10.50 Institutional Trousers - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -9X
$12.69 $9.54 $39.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.09

4.10.51 Institutional Trousers - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -10X
$12.69 $9.90 $43.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.09

4.10.52 Institutional V-Neck Shirts  - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -Small
$6.02 $6.90 $16.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.65

4.10.53 Institutional V-Neck Shirts  - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -Medium
$6.02 $6.90 $16.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.65

4.10.54 Institutional V-Neck Shirts  - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -Large
$6.56 $6.90 $16.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.65

4.10.55 Institutional V-Neck Shirts  - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -XLarge
$6.86 $6.90 $16.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.65

4.10.56 Institutional V-Neck Shirts  - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -2X
$6.86 $6.90 $17.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.65

4.10.57 Institutional V-Neck Shirts  - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -3X
$7.43 $7.54 $19.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.99

4.10.58 Institutional V-Neck Shirts  - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -4X
$7.93 $7.90 $21.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.33

4.10.59 Institutional V-Neck Shirts  - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -6X
$8.46 $8.54 $26.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.17

4.10.60 Institutional V-Neck Shirts  - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -8X
$8.93 $8.90 $32.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.17

4.10.61 Institutional V-Neck Shirts  - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -9X
$8.93 $8.90 $36.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.17

4.10.62 Institutional V-Neck Shirts  - Black & White 

Horizontal Stripes -l0X
$8.93 $8.90 $39.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.17
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4.10.63 Institutional Trousers • Green - Lettering - 

Small
$8.99 $7.54 $16.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.29

4.10.64 Institutional Trousers • Green - Lettering - 

Medium
$8.99 $7.54 $16.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.29

4.10.65 Institutional Trousers -  Green - Lettering  • 

Large
$8.99 $7.54 $16.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.29

4.10.66 Institutional Trousers -  Green - Lettering  - 

Xlarge
$8.99 $7.54 $16.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.29

4.10.67 Institutional Trousers -  Green - Lettering  - 

2X
$8.99 $7.54 $17.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.29

4.10.68 Institutional Trousers -  Green - Lettering - 

3X
$8.99 $7.90 $19.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.84

4.10.69 Institutional Trousers -  Green - Lettering  - 

4X
$9.99 $7.90 $21.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.14

4.10.70 Institutional Trousers -  Green - Lettering  - 

6X
$10.64 $8.54 $26.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.17

4.10.71 Institutional Trousers -  Green - Lettering  -

8X
$12.88 $8.90 $31.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.09

4.10.72 Institutional Trousers - Green - Lettering  -

9X
$12.88 $9.54 $34.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.09

4.10.73 Institutional Trousers - Green - Lettering  -

l0X
$14.88 $9.90 $37.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.09

4.10.74 Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green - Lettering 

- Small
$7.00 $6.90 $14.35 No Bid $15.00 No Bid $6.65

4.10.75 Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green - Lettering 

- Medium
$7.40 $6.90 $14.35 No Bid $15.00 No Bid $6.65

4.10.76 Institutional V-Neck Shirt  -  Green - 

Lettering  - Large
$7.67 $6.90 $14.35 No Bid $16.00 No Bid $6.65

4.10.77 Institutional V-Neck Shirt  -  Green - 

Lettering  - XLarge
$7.78 $6.90 $14.35 No Bid $15.00 No Bid $6.65

4.10.78 Institutional V-Neck Shirt  -  Green - 

Lettering  - 2X
$7.78 $6.90 $15.79 No Bid $20.00 No Bid $6.65

4.10.79 Institutional V-Neck Shirt -  Green - 

Lettering - 3X
$8.10 $7.54 $17.22 No Bid $21.00 No Bid $6.99

4.10.80 Institutional V-Neck Shirt  -  Green - 

Lettering  - 4X
$8.10 $7.90 $18.84 No Bid $22.00 No Bid $7.33

4.10.81 Institutional V-Neck Shirt  -  Green - 

Lettering  - 6X
$9.27 $8.54 $23.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.17

4.10.82 Institutional V-Neck Shirt  -  Green - 

Lettering  -8X
$10.88 $8.90 $28.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.17

4.10.83 Institutional V-Neck Shirt - Green - Lettering  

-9X
$10.88 $8.90 $31.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.17

4.10.84 Institutional V-Neck Shirt  - Green - 

Lettering  -l0X
$11.88 $8.90 $33.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.17
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4.10.85 Institutional Sweatpants - Grey No Lettering 

- Small
$5.85 $6.54 $18.13 No Bid $22.00 No Bid $6.86

4.10.86 Institutional Sweatpants - Grey - No 

Lettering - Medium
$5.85 $6.54 $18.13 No Bid $22.00 No Bid $6.86

4.10.87 Institutional Sweatpants - Grey - No 

Lettering  - Large
$5.85 $6.54 $18.13 No Bid $22.00 No Bid $6.86

4.10.88 Institutional Sweatpants - Grey - No 

Lettering  - XLarge
$5.85 $6.54 $18.13 No Bid $22.00 No Bid $6.86

4.10.89 Institutional Sweatpants - Grey - No 

Lettering  - 2X
$5.85 $6.90 $20.86 No Bid $25.00 No Bid $6.86

4.10.90 Institutional Sweatpants - Grey - No 

Lettering - 3X
$5.85 $6.90 $23.59 No Bid $26.60 No Bid $6.86

4.10.91 Institutional Sweatpants - Grey - No 

Lettering  - 4X
$5.85 $7.90 $26.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.86

4.10.92 Institutional Sweatpants - Grey - No 

Lettering - 6X
$6.85 $8.90 $32.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.38

4.10.93 Institutional Sweatpants - Grey - No 

Lettering  -8X
$8.85 $9.90 $40.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.38

4.10.94 Institutional Sweatpants - Grey - No 

Lettering  -9X
No Bid $9.90 $45.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.38

4.10.95 Institutional Sweatpants No Lettering  -l0X
$9.95 $9.90 $49.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.38

4.10.96 Institutional Shirts - Grey No Lettering - 

Small
$7.00 $6.54 $16.03 No Bid $16.00 No Bid $6.65

4.10.97 Institutional Shirts - Grey No Lettering - 

Medium
$7.30 $6.54 $16.03 No Bid $15.00 No Bid $6.65

4.10.98 Institutional Shirts - Grey No Lettering  - 

Large
$7.88 $6.54 $16.03 No Bid $15.00 No Bid $6.65

4.10.99 Institutional Shirts - Grey No Lettering   - 

XLarge
$8.10 $6.54 $16.03 No Bid $15.00 No Bid $6.65

4.10.100 Institutional Shirts - Grey No Lettering  - 2X
$8.30 $6.90 $18.45 No Bid $20.00 No Bid $6.65

4.10.101 Institutional Shirts - Grey No Lettering - 3X
$8.30 $6.90 $20.87 No Bid $22.00 No Bid $7.33

4.10.102 Institutional Shirts - Grey No Lettering  - 4X
$8.30 $7.90 $23.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.17

4.10.103 Institutional Shirts - Grey No Lettering - 6X
$9.52 $8.90 $28.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.17

4.10.104 Institutional Shirts - Grey No Lettering  -8X
$9.52 $9.90 $36.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.17

4.10.105 Institutional Shirts - Grey No Lettering -9X
$9.52 $9.90 $40.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.106 Institutional Shirts - Grey No Lettering -l0X
$9.52 $9.90 $44.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.10.70.1 1st Renewal options Percentage Price 

Adjustment
3% 5% 20% 5% No Bid No Bid 3%

4.10.70.2 2nd Renewal Option Percentage Price 

Adjustment
5% 5% 20% 7% No Bid No Bid 3%

4.10.70.3 3rd Renewal Option Percentage Price 

Adjustment
7% 5% 20% 7% No Bid No Bid 3%

Co-Op Y Y Y Y Y Y Y


